Form P-359 Rev. 12-19-2007

# **TABULATION**

		DESC	CRIPTION:				
Cab & Chass	sis				CONTRACT NO.:	H-14-321R	DATE OPENED: 5/6/2014
					FOB:	Statewide	PAGE: 1 of 8
Landers Ford P. O. Box 1649 VENDOR: Benton, AR 72018 Rick Layton (501) 680-2359							
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	1		23,373.00	2015 Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Order Cutoff
2.	7	25,669.00	179,683.00	2015 Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Order Cutoff
3.	4	32,484.00	129,936.00	2015 Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Order Cutoff
4.	6	29,339.00	176,034.00	2015 Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Order Cutoff
5.	2	45,066.00	90,132.00	2015 Ford	F450	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Order Cutoff
6.	1		33,715.00	2015 Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Order Cutoff
TOTAL: 632,873.00							
RECOMMENDED AWARD: 509,026.00							
							CARD: 00-25
TENTATIVE AWARD BY: Purchasing Committee						DATE: 5/20/2014	
		ITEM(S):	1 - 4 only				

AWARDED TO: Landers Ford (6/13/14)

Form P-359 Rev. 12-19-2007

#### **TABULATION**

**DESCRIPTION:** CONTRACT NO.: H-14-321R DATE OPENED: 5/6/2014 Cab & Chassis FOB: Statewide PAGE: 2 of 8 Cavenaugh Ford Lincoln P. O. Box 429 VENDOR: Walnut Ridge, AR 72476 Keith Brawley (870) 886-2414 ITEM NO. EXTENSION ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES QTY. PRICE MAKE MODEL DELIVERY 1. 1 23,843.80 2015 Ford F-350 90 Days (unless Factory delay) 5/1/2015 2. 26,179.80 183,258.60 2015 Ford F-350 90 Days (unless Factory delay) 5/1/2015 7 3. 4 F-350 34,164.80 136,659.20 2015 Ford 90 Days (unless Factory delay) 5/1/2015 4. 6 30,949.80 185,698.80 2015 Ford F-350 5/1/2015 90 Days (unless Factory delay) 2 5. N/B 33,294.80 2015 Ford F-350 90 Days (unless Factory delay) 5/1/2015 6. 1 TOTAL: 562,755.20 **RECOMMENDED AWARD:** CARD: 00-25 TENTATIVE AWARD BY: \_\_\_\_\_ DATE: ITEM(S):\_\_\_\_\_ AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_

Form P-359 Rev. 12-19-2007

# **TABULATION**

Cab & Chassis					CONTRACT NO.:	H-14-321R	DATE OPENED: 5/6/2014
					FOB:	Statewide	PAGE: 3 of 8
VENDOR:	P. O. I Morrilt John I	n Ford Lincoln Box 843 on, AR 72110 Magie 354-4541					
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	1		23,973.00	Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Cutoff
2.	7	26,289.00	184,023.00	Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Cutoff
3.	4	33,274.00	133,096.00	Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Cutoff
4.	6	29,989.00	179,934.00	Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Cutoff
5.	2	45,287.00	90,574.00	Ford	F450	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Cutoff
6.	1 32,982.00 Ford		F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Fleet Cutoff		
TOTAL: 644,582.00							
RECOMMENDED AWARD: 32,982.00							
TENTATIVE AWARD BY: Purchasing Committee						DATE: 5/20/2014	CARD: 00-25
ITEM(S): #6 ONLY							
AWARDED TO: Allison Ford Lincoln (6/2/2014)						_	

Form P-359 Rev. 12-19-2007

## **TABULATION**

Cab & Chass	sis	DESC	CRIPTION:		CONTRACT NO.:	H-14-321R	DATE OPENED: 5/6/2014
					FOB:	Statewide	PAGE: 4 of 8
VENDOR:	Hot Sp Dennie (501)	Central Avenue orings, AR 719 e Spencer 525-0800	913				
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	1		24,623.00	2015 Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Model Year Balance Out
2.	7	26,959.00	188,713.00	2015 Ford	F350	90 Days ARO	2015 Model Year Balance Out
3.	4	33,944.00	135,776.00	2015 Ford	F350	120 Days ARO	2015 Model Year Balance Out
4.	6	30,729.00	184,374.00	2015 Ford	F350	120 Days ARO	2015 Model Year Balance Out
5.	2	44,923.00	89,846.00	2015 Ford	F450	120 Days ARO	2015 Model Year Balance Out
6.	1		33,154.00	2015 Ford	F350	120 Days ARO	2015 Model Year Balance Out
TOTAL: 656,486.00							
RECO	MMEND	ED AWARD:	89,846.00				
TENTATIVE AWARD BY: Purchasing Committee						DATE: <u>5/20/2014</u>	CARD: 00-25
	۸۱/	ITEM(S):					
AWARDED TO: Riser Ford (6/2/2014)							

Form P-359 Rev. 12-19-2007

# **TABULATION**

Cab & Chas	sis				CONTRACT NO.:	H-14-321R	DATE OPENED: 5/6/2014
					FOB:	Statewide	PAGE: 5 of 8
	5900 Fort S Dean (479)	Hwy. 71 south mith, AR 729 Pendergrass 646-4731					
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	1		24,006.00	Dodge	Ram 3500	150 Days	Not Listed
2.	7	28,328.00	198,296.00	*Dodge	Ram 3500	150 Days	Not Listed
3.	4	35,709.75	142,839.00	*Dodge	Ram 3500	150 Days	Not Listed
4.	6	32,198.00	193,188.00	*Dodge	Ram 3500	150 Days	Not Listed
5.	2	47,552.00	95,104.00	Dodge	Ram 4500	150 Days	Not Listed
6.	1		36,109.00	*Dodge	Ram 3500	150 Days	Not Listed
		*Exc	eption to Specificati	ons			
TOTAL: 689,542.00							
RECO	MMEND	ED AWARD:					
							CARD: 00-25
TENTATIVE AWARD BY:						DATE:	
ITEM(S):							
AWARDED TO:							

Form P-359 Rev. 12-19-2007

# **TABULATION**

Cab & Chas	sis				CONTRACT NO.:	H-14-321R	DATE OPENED: <u>5/6/2014</u>
					FOB:	Statewide	PAGE: 6 of 8
	Cavenaugh GM SuperStore 3227 Hwy. 67 North  VENDOR: Walnut Ridge, AR 72476 Ronald Cavenaugh (870) 886-3561						
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	1		23,840.50	2015 Chevrolet	3500	90 Days from P. O. Date	9/1/2014
2.	7	26,821.50	187,750.50	2015 Chevrolet	3500	90 Days from P. O. Date	9/1/2014
3.	4	34,773.06	139,092.24	2015 Chevrolet	3500	90 Days from P. O. Date	9/1/2014
4.	6	31,492.25	188,953.50	2015 Chevrolet	3500	90 Days from P. O. Date	9/1/2014
5.	2		N/B				
6.	1		34,636.00	2015 Chevrolet	3500	90 Days from P. O. Date	9/1/2014
TOTAL: 574,272.74							
RECO	MMENE	DED AWARD:					
							CARD: 00-25
TENTATIVE AWARD BY:						DATE:	
ITEM(S):						-	
AWARDED TO:						_	

Form P-359 Rev. 12-19-2007

## **TABULATION**

Cab & Chassis					CONTRACT NO.:	H-14-321R	DATE OPENED:	5/6/2014
					FOB:	Statewide	PAGE:	7 of 8
Performance Chevrolet-Buick-Pontiac- Inc. PO Box R VENDOR: Camden, AR 71711								
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT P	URCHASES
1.	1		Rejected - No Bid	Bond				
2.	7							
3.	4							
4.	6							
5.	2							
6.	1							
		TOTAL:					•	
RECOI	MMEND	ED AWARD:						
							CARD:	00-25
TENTATIVE AWARD BY:						DATE:		
		ITEM(S):						
AWARDED TO:								

Form P-359 Rev. 12-19-2007

## **TABULATION**

Cab & Chassis				CONTRACT NO.: _	H-14-321R	DATE OPENED: 5/6/2014
				FOB:	Statewide	PAGE: 8 of 8
118 W	. Main					
QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1		Rejected - No Bid	Bond			
7						
4						
6						
2						
1						
	TOTAL:					
MMEND	ED AWARD:					
						CARD: 00-25
TENTATIVE AWARD BY:					DATE:	
	ITEM(S):					
AW	ARDED TO:					
	Cavena 118 W Walnut QTY. 1 7 4 6 2 1 1 MMEND	Cavenaugh Chrysle 118 W. Main Walnut Ridge, AR  QTY. PRICE  1  7  4  6  2  1  TOTAL: MMENDED AWARD: ITEM(S):	Cavenaugh Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram 118 W. Main Walnut Ridge, AR 72476   QTY. PRICE EXTENSION  1 Rejected - No Bid  7 4 6 2 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	Cavenaugh Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram 118 W. Main Walnut Ridge, AR 72476   QTY. PRICE EXTENSION MAKE  1 Rejected - No Bid Bond  7 4 6  2 1  1 TOTAL: MMENDED AWARD:  ITEM(S):	Cavenaugh Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram 118 W. Main Walnut Ridge, AR 72476   QTY. PRICE EXTENSION MAKE MODEL  1 Rejected - No Bid Bond  7 4 6 6 6 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9	Cavenaugh Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram